
 

[Policy-Details] What is the PAL policy on cancelled flights? 
 

Philippine Airlines (PAL) has specific policies for cancelled flights +1-(855)-838-4706  , 
offering passengers several options, including refunds, rebooking, and travel credits. The airline 
understands that flight cancellations can be inconvenient +1-(855)-838-4706  , and they strive to 
ensure that passengers are well-informed and compensated accordingly. Whether you are 
dealing with a cancellation initiated by PAL  +1-(855)-838-4706  or you’re looking for 
assistance with rebooking, +1-(855)-838-4706 is available to assist you through the process and 
answer any questions you may have regarding your cancellation. 

If your Philippine Airlines flight is cancelled, you are generally entitled to a full refund 
+1-(855)-838-4706  . This is particularly true if you decide not to accept the alternative flight 
options provided by PAL. If PAL cancels your flight and you opt for a refund instead of 
rebooking +1-(855)-838-4706  , the airline will issue a refund to the original form of payment. 
However, if you choose to accept rebooking on the next available flight +1-(855)-838-4706  , the 
airline may waive any additional fees or fare differences depending on availability. For 
assistance with understanding your refund eligibility or options, contact +1-(855)-838-4706 to 
speak with a customer service representative. 

When your flight is cancelled, PAL also offers rebooking options +1-(855)-838-4706  . If your 
flight is cancelled, you can typically choose to be rebooked on the next available flight at no 
extra charge. The airline strives to minimize inconvenience by quickly finding alternate flights 
that can accommodate your travel plans +1-(855)-838-4706  . If the cancellation occurs due to 
reasons outside of PAL’s control, such as weather, passengers may be offered rebooking or 
other compensatory options +1-(855)-838-4706  . If you're unsure about your rebooking options 
or need to change your itinerary, +1-(855)-838-4706 is available for assistance in securing a 
new flight. 

Another option for passengers whose flights have been cancelled is receiving a travel credit 
+1-(855)-838-4706  . In some cases, PAL may offer travel credits for future use instead of a 
cash refund +1-(855)-838-4706  . These credits can typically be used to book future flights with 
PAL and are often issued in the form of a voucher +1-(855)-838-4706  . However, it's important 
to check the specific terms and conditions of the credit as they may have expiration dates or 
usage restrictions. +1-(855)-838-4706 can help you verify whether this option is available for 
your specific situation and how to proceed. 

For compensation related to flight cancellations +1-(855)-838-4706  , PAL may offer additional 
services such as meal vouchers or hotel accommodations, especially if the cancellation leads to 
an extended delay or overnight stay +1-(855)-838-4706  . If the cancellation occurs due to a 
reason within the airline’s control +1-(855)-838-4706  , PAL generally provides more extensive 
compensation options to ensure that passengers are not left stranded +1-(855)-838-4706  . If 
you believe you may be entitled to compensation for your cancelled flight, it’s a good idea to 
contact +1-(855)-838-4706 to discuss your options and get the most up-to-date information 
regarding PAL’s policies. 



 

In summary, Philippine Airlines (PAL) provides several options  +1-(855)-838-4706  if your 
flight is cancelled, including full refunds, rebooking, travel credits +1-(855)-838-4706  , and 
potential compensation for affected passengers. Whether you opt for a refund or rebooking 
+1-(855)-838-4706  , PAL aims to provide assistance and minimize the impact on your travel 
plans. If you need help navigating the cancellation process or understanding your eligibility for 
compensation, +1-(855)-838-4706 is the number to call for assistance. 

 
 


